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 FABRIC PROTECTOR 

 
 
This product is a sophisticated combination of chemicals with 
a fluoroethylene polymer base designed to form an invisible 
antistatic shield. It will keep dirt, dust and grime from clinging 
to fabric fibres and keep wet soil from penetrating.  
Vacuuming will remove more soil from treated carpets and 
other fabrics and prevent dirt from becoming imbedded under 
the surface where it does the most damage.  
Fabric Protector may be used on carpet, upholstery and 
drapes. Its effectiveness will vary with type of fabric. Each 
type of fabric must be pre-tested. This is particularly advisable 
for use on interior fabrics of automobiles where different types 
of dyes are used. 
 
DIRECTIONS: Uniformly spray product with a fine spray on 
clean carpet or upholstery using a spray tank or trigger 
sprayer. It may be applied to either damp or dry fabric. For 
damp fabrics, dilute 1 part product with 1 part water. For dry 
fabrics, dilute 1 part product with 4 parts water. In either case, 
1 litre of product should cover an area of approximately 23 
square meters or 250 square feet. 
Brush the fabric lightly and set the nap with a soft bristle brush 
or a sponge slightly dampened with Fabric Protector. Allow 
the fabric to dry before use. To enhance the appearance of 
some fabrics it may be desirable to brush and vacuum after 
drying.  
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